EERramgan wru o=

LAWS OF MALAYSIA
Act A1411

PENSIONS ADJUSTMENT (AMENDMENT)
ACT 2011



Date of Royal Assent 30 December 2011

Date of publication in the
Gazette 31 December 2011

Publisher’s Copyright @
PERCETAKAN NASIONAL MALAYSIA BERHAD
All rights reserved. No part of this publication may be reproduced, stored in a retrieval system or transmitted in any form or by any means

electronic, mechanical, photocopying, recording and/or otherwise without the prior permission of Percetakan Nasional Malaysia Berhad
(Appointed Printer to the Government of Malaysia).



LAWS OF MALAYSIA

Act A1411

PENSIONS ADJUSTMENT (AMENDMENT)
ACT 2011

An Act to amend the Pensions Adjustment Act 1980.

ENACTED by the Parliament of Malaysia as follows:

Short title and commencement

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Pensions Adjustment
(Amendment) Act 2011.

(2) This Act comes into operation on 1 January 2012.

Amendment of section 4

2. The Pensions Adjustment Act 1980 [Act 238], which is referred
to as the “principal Act” in this Act, is amended in section 4 by
substituting for the words “twelve and a half years”, wherever
they appear, the words “twenty years”.

Amendment of section 5
3. Section 5 of the principal Act is amended by substituting for

the words “twelve and a half years”, wherever they appear, the
words “twenty years”.



4 Laws of Malaysia Act Al1411

Savings and transitional

4. The payment of derivative pension or derivative retiring
allowance in consequence of the amendment made under sections
2 and 3 of this Act to persons other than those mentioned in
subsections 4(3) and 5(4) of the principal Act, if the period of
twelve and a half years has expired before 1 January 2012, shall
be dealt with as follows:

(a) the period of twenty years shall be calculated from the
date of the retirement of the officer;

(b) the persons shall not be entitled to the payment of
derivative pension or derivative retiring allowance for
the period after the expiration of the period of twelve
and a half years until 31 December 2011; and

(c) the payment of derivative pension or derivative retiring
allowance shall only be made from 1 January 2012.

DICETAK OLEH
PERCETAKAN NASIONAL MALAYSIA BERHAD,
KUALA LUMPUR

BAGI PIHAK DAN DENGAN PERINTAH KERAJAAN MALAYSIA
PNMB



