31 Mac 2017
31 March 2017
P.U. (A) 101

WARTA KERAJAAN PERSEKUTUAN

FEDERAL GOVERNMENT
GAZETTE

PERINTAH DUTI KASTAM (PINDAAN) 2017

CUSTOMS DUTIES (AMENDMENT) ORDER 2017

DISIARKAN OLEH/
PUBLISHED BY
JABATAN PEGUAM NEGARA/
ATTORNEY GENERAL’S CHAMBERS

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia




P.U. (A) 101

AKTA KASTAM 1967

PERINTAH DUTI KASTAM (PINDAAN) 2017

PADA menjalankan kuasa yang diberikan oleh subseksyen 11(1) Akta Kastam 1967

[Akta 235], Menteri membuat perintah yang berikut:

Nama dan permulaan kuat kuasa

1. (1)

(2)

Perintah ini bolehlah dinamakan Perintah Duti Kastam (Pindaan) 2017.

Perintah ini mula berkuat kuasa pada 1 April 2017.

Pindaan Jadual Pertama

2. Perintah Duti Kastam 2017 [P.U. (A) 5/2017] dipinda dalam Jadual Pertama—

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

berhubung dengan subkepala 0105.11.90 00, dalam ruang (5), dengan
menggantikan perkataan “RM” dengan perkataan “TRQ”;

dengan menggantikan subkepala “0303.45.00” dengan subkepala “0303.45";
dengan menggantikan subkepala “0709.99.00”, “0709.99.00 107
“0709.99.00 20” dan “0709.99.00 90" masing-masing dengan

subkepala “0709.99”, “0709.99.10 00”, “0709.99.20 00” dan “0709.99.90 00”;

berhubung dengan subkepala 0813.50.40 dan 8422.90, dengan memotong
butir-butir dalam ruang (4), (5) dan (6);

berhubung dengan kepala 12.12—

(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala “1212.21.00 00” dengan
subkepala “1212.21”; dan

2

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(i) dengan memotong butir-butir dalam ruang (4), (5) dan (6) yang
terdapat bersetentangan dengan perkataan “- - - Dried but not ground:”

dalam ruang (3);

(f) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 13, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 1(i) dan (j) masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 1(ij)
dan (k);

(g) selepas subkepala 1511.90.20 00 dan butir-butir yang berhubungan
dengannya, dengan memotong butir-butir dalam ruang (4), (5) dan (6) yang

terdapat bersetentangan dengan perkataan “- - Fractions of refined oil:”;

(h) dengan menggantikan subkepala “2204.21.12 00” dan “2204.21.13 00”
masing-masing dengan subkepala “2204.21.13 00” dan “2204.21.14 00”;

(i) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 25, dengan menomborkan semula

subperenggan 2(i) sebagai subperenggan 2(ij);

(j) berhubung dengan subkepala 2715.00.10 00, dalam ruang (5), dengan

menggantikan perkataan “5%” dengan perkataan “25%";

(k) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 29, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 2(i), (j) dan (k) masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 2(ij), (k)
dan (1);

(I) dengan menggantikan subkepala “2903.21 00 00” dengan subkepala
“2903.21.00 007;

(m) dengan menggantikan subkepala “2918.91 00 00” dengan subkepala
“2918.91.00 007;

3

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



@)

(o)

(p)

(@)

P.U. (A) 101

berhubung dengan kepala 39.17—

(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3917.29 22 00” dengan
subkepala “3917.29.22 00”;

(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3917.29 23 00” dengan
subkepala “3917.29.23 00”;

(iii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3917.29 24 00” dengan
subkepala “3917.29.24 00”;

(iv) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3917.29 25 00” dengan
subkepala “3917.29.25 00”; dan

(v) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3917.29 29 00” dengan
subkepala “3917.29.29 00”;

berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 30, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 4(i), (j) dan (k) masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 4(ij), (k)

dan (1);

berhubung dengan kepala 34.03, dengan menggantikan subkepala “3402.11”
dengan subkepala “3403.11";

berhubung dengan subkepala 3808.69.90, dengan menggantikan
subkepala “3808.62.90 10” dan “3808.62.90 90” masing-masing dengan

subkepala “3808.69.90 10” dan “3808.69.90 90”;

dengan menggantikan subkepala “3917.29.00” dengan subkepala “3917.29”;

4

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(s) berhubung dengan kepala 39.20—

(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3920.43.00” dengan
subkepala “3920.43";

(ii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3920.51.00” dengan
subkepala “3920.51%;

(iii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3920.59.00” dengan
subkepala “3920.59”;

(iv) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3920.69.00” dengan
subkepala “3920.69”; dan

(v) dengan menggantikan subkepala “3920.93.00” dengan
subkepala “3920.93%;

(t) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 39—

(i) dengan menomborkan semula subperenggan 2(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n),
(o), (p), (q), (1), (s), (t), (u), (v), (W), (x) dan (y) masing-masing sebagai
subperenggan 2(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (), (@), (1), (), (1), (W), (v), (W),
(x), (v) dan (z); dan

(i) dengan menomborkan semula subperenggan 11(i) sebagai

subperenggan 11(ij);

(u) berhubung dengan kepala 39.21, dengan menggantikan
subkepala 3921.90.90 00 dan butir-butir yang berhubungan dengannya
dengan subkepala dan butir-butir yang berikut:

5

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity
Import Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
3921.90.90 - Other:
3921.90.90 10 - - Of additional kg 20% 0%
polymerisation
products
3921.90.90 90 - - Other kg 0% 0%

(v) berhubung dengan kepala 39.24—

(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala 3924.10.90 00 dan butir-butir yang
berhubungan dengannya dengan subkepala dan butir-butir yang
berikut:

“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity
Import Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
3924.10.90 - Other:
3924.10.90 10 - - Baby feeding kg 0% 0%
bottles
3924.10.90 90 - - Other kg 20% 0%

(ii) berhubung dengan subkepala 3924.90.90 20, dalam ruang (3), dengan

memotong perkataan “(including baby feeding bottle)”;

(w) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 42, dengan menomborkan semula

subperenggan 2(i), (j), (k) dan (1) masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 2(ij),
(k), (1) dan (m);

(x) berhubung dengan Bab 44—

berhubung dengan Nota

Bab, dengan menomborkan

semula

subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p) dan (q) masing-masing
sebagai subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (q) dan (r); dan

6

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia

”;dan



P.U. (A) 101

(i) berhubung dengan Nota Nasional, dengan memasukkan selepas

perenggan 1 perenggan yang berikut:

“2. For the purposes of heading 44.03, the expression “Baulks”
means “timber that has been converted with a saw or split by
wedges or hewn having a cross section of not less than 60 squares

inches (375 sq. cm).”;

(y) berhubung dengan kepala 44.03—

(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 11" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 31”;

(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 12~ dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 327;

(iii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 13” dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 33”;

(iv) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 14~ dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 34”;

(v) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 15" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 35%;

(vi) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 16" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 36”;

(vii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 17~ dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 37”;

(viii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 18" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 38”;

7

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



(ix)

)

(xi)

(xii)

(xiii)

(xiv)

(xv)

(xvi)

(xvii)

dengan menggantikan subkepala

subkepala “4403.49.10 39%;

dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 21"

“4403.49.10

19"

P.U. (A) 101

dengan

dan butir-butir

yang berhubungan dengannya dalam ruang (3) dengan subkepala dan

butir-butir yang berikut:

“ Subheading Description
(2) (3)

4403.49.10 41 - - - - Of Kelat (Ubah) | ”;
dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 22"
subkepala “4403.49.10 42”;
dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 23"
subkepala “4403.49.10 43”;
dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 24"
subkepala “4403.49.10 44”;
dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 25"
subkepala “4403.49.10 45”;
dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 26"
subkepala “4403.49.10 46”;
dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 27~
subkepala “4403.49.10 47”;
dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 28"
subkepala “4403.49.10 48”;

(xviii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 29"

subkepala “4403.49.10 497;
8

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia

dengan

dengan

dengan

dengan

dengan

dengan

dengan

dengan



P.U. (A) 101

(xix) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 31" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 517%;

(xx) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 32" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 527;

(xxi) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 33” dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 537;

(xxii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 34” dan butir-butir
yang berhubungan dengannya dalam ruang (3) dengan subkepala dan

butir-butir yang berikut:

“ Subheading Description
(2) (3)
4403.49.1054 |- - - - - OfLimpaga
(Surian) "

(xxiii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 35" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 557;

(xxiv) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 36" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 56”;

(xxv) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 37” dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 57”;

(xxvi) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 38" dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 58”; dan

(xxvii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4403.49.10 39” dengan
subkepala “4403.49.10 597;

9

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



berhubung dengan kepala 44.03, dengan menggantikan
“4403.99.10 117,

“4403.99.107,

“4403.99.10 14”7,
“4403.99.10 18",
“4403.99.10 237,
“4403.99.10 277,
“4403.99.10 327,

“4403.99.10 127,

“4403.99.10 15", “4403.99.10 16",
“4403.99.10 197, “4403.99.10 21",
“4403.99.10 24", “4403.99.10 257,
“4403.99.10 28", “4403.99.10 297,
“4403.99.10 33", “4403.99.10 347,

P.U. (A) 101

subkepala
“4403.99.10 137,
“4403.99.10 177,
“4403.99.10 227,
“4403.99.10 267,
“4403.99.10 317,
“4403.99.10 35”,

“4403.99.10 36", “4403.99.10 37", “4403.99.10 38", “4403.99.10 39” dan

“4403.99.10 90” dan butir-butir yang berhubungan dengannya dengan

subkepala dan butir-butir yang berikut:

Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
4403.99.10 Baulks, sawlogs and
veener logs:
- Heavy
hardwoods of a
density  above
880kg per m3:
4403.99.10 06 - - OfGiam m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 11 - - OfPenyau m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 15 - - Other m3 0% 15%
- Medium
hardwoods of a
density between
720 to 880kg per
m3:
4403.99.10 16 - - OfBekak m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 20 - - OfKandis m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 22 - - OfKayu Malam m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 32 - - Of Merbatu m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 34 - - OfMertas m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 35 - - OfNyalin m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 37 - - OfPerah m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 47 - - Of Tulang m3 0% 15%
Daing (Kedang
Belum)
4403.99.10 49 - - Other m3 0% 15%
- Light hardwoods
of a density
below 720kg per
m3:
4403.99.10 51 - - OfAra m3 0% 15%
10

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia




P.U. (A) 101

Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
4403.99.10 56 - - OfBerangan m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 67 - - OfKetapang m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 69 - - OfLaran m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 76 - - Of Mempisang m3 0% 15%
(Karai)
4403.99.10 82 - - Of Penarahan m3 0% 15%
(Kumpang)
4403.99.10 83 - - Of Perupok m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 92 - - OfTerentang m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 95 - - Other m3 0% 15%
(aa) berhubung dengan kepala 44.07, dengan menggantikan subkepala

“4407.99.90”,

“4407.99.90.14”",
“4407.99.90.18",
“4407.99.90.23%,
“4407.99.90.27",
“4407.99.90.32",
“4407.99.90.36”,

“4407.99.90.11",
“4407.99.90.15"%,

“4407.99.90.12%,
“4407.99.90.16”,

“4407.99.90.19”, “4407.99.90.21”,
“4407.99.90.24”,  “4407.99.90.25",
“4407.99.90.28", “4407.99.90.29”,
“4407.99.90.33",  “4407.99.90.34",
“4407.99.90.37”, “4407.99.90.38",

“4407.99.90.13",
“4407.99.90.17",
“4407.99.90.22%,
“4407.99.90.26",
“4407.99.90.31%,
“4407.99.90.35”,

“4407.99.90.39” dan

“4407.99.90.90” dan butir-butir yang berhubungan dengannya dengan

subkepala dan butir-butir yang berikut:

Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
4407.99.90 Other:
- Heavy
hardwoods of a
density  above
880kg per m3:
4407.99.90 06 - - OfGiam m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 11 - - OfPenyau m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 15 - - Other m3 0% 0%
- Medium
hardwoods of a
density between
720 to 880kg per
m3;
4407.99.90 16 - - OfBekak m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 20 - - OfKandis m3 0% 0%
11

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
4407.99.90 22 - - OfKayu Malam m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 32 - - OfMerbatu m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 34 - - OfMertas m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 35 - - OfNyalin m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 37 - - OfPerah m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 47 - - Of Tulang m3 0% 0%
Daing (Kedang
Belum)
4407.99.90 49 - - Other m3 0% 0%
- Light hardwoods
of a density
below 720kg per
m3:
4407.99.90 51 - - OfAra m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 56 - - OfBerangan m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 67 - - OfKetapang m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 69 - - OfLaran m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 76 - - Of Mempisang m3 0% 0%
(Karai)
4407.99.90 82 - - Of Penarahan m3 0% 0%
(Kumpang)
4407.99.90 83 - - OfPerupok m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 92 - - OfTerentang m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 95 - - Other m3 0% 0%
(ab) berhubung dengan kepala 46.02—
(i) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4602.11.00” dengan
subkepala “4602.11%;
(ii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4602.12.00” dengan
subkepala “4602.12%;
(iii) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4602.19.00” dengan
subkepala “4602.19”; dan
(iv) dengan menggantikan subkepala “4602.90.00” dengan

subkepala “4602.90”;

12

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(ac) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 48, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 2(i), (j), (k), (I), (m), (n), (o) dan (p) masing-masing sebagai
subperenggan 2(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p) dan (q);

(ad) dengan
subkepala “4910.00.00";

menggantikan subkepala “4910.00.00 00” dengan

(ae) berhubung dengan Nota Seksyen kepada Seksyen XI, dengan menomborkan
semula subperenggan 1(i), (i), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (@), (v), (s), (t) dan (u)
masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (q), (1),
(s), (t), (u) dan (v);

(af) berhubung dengan kepala 63.04, dengan menggantikan subkepala

“6304.19.90 00” dan butir-butir yang berhubungan dengannya dengan

subkepala dan butir-butir yang berikut:

‘| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
6304.19.90 00 - - - Other kg 0% 0%
(ag) dengan menggantikan subkepala “6308.00.00” dengan

subkepala “6308.00.00 00”;

(ah) dengan menggantikan subkepala “6406.20.00” dengan subkepala “6406.20”;

(ai) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 68, dengan menomborkan semula

1), (G), (k), () dan (m) masing-masing
subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m) dan (n);

subperenggan sebagai

(aj) dengan menggantikan subkepala “6815.10 91 00” dan “6815.10 99 00”
masing-masing dengan subkepala “6815.10.91 00” dan “6815.10.99 00”;

13

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia




P.U. (A) 101

(ak) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 69, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 2(i), (j), (k) dan (1) masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 2(ij),
(k), (1) dan (m);

(al) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 71, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 3(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n) dan (o) masing-masing sebagai
subperenggan 3(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o) dan (p);

(am) berhubung dengan Nota Seksyen kepada Seksyen XV, dengan menomborkan
semula subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k), () dan (m) masing-masing sebagai
subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m) dan (n);

(an) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 72, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n) dan (o) masing-masing sebagai
subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o) dan (p);

(ao) berhubung dengan kepala 72.08, dalam ruang (2), dengan memotong
subkepala “7208.27” yang terdapat bersetentangan dengan perkataan
“- - - Other:” dalam ruang (3);

(ap) dengan  menggantikan  subkepala “7212.60.91 00" dengan
subkepala “7212.60.91";

(aq) berhubung dengan Nota Seksyen kepada Seksyen XVI, dengan menomborkan
semula subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o) dan (p) masing-masing
sebagai subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o) (p) dan (q);

(ar) berhubung dengan kepala 84.14, dengan menggantikan
subkepala 8414.80.21 00 dan 8414.80.29 00 dan butir-butir yang

berhubungan dengannya dengan subkepala dan butir-butir yang berikut:

14

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

“| Heading | Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
(1) (2) (3) Quantity | Import Export
(4) (5) (6)
- - Not fitted
with a filter:
8414.80.2100 |- - - - Suitable u 20% 0%
for
industrial
use
8414.80.2900 |- - - - Other u 30% 0%

(as) berhubung dengan kepala 84.24—

(i) dalam ruang (3), selepas subkepala 8424.30.00 00 dan butir-butir yang
berhubungan  dengannya, dengan menggantikan perkataan

- - Agricultural or horticultural sprayers:” dengan perkataan

“- Agricultural or horticultural sprayers:”; dan

(i) dengan memasukkan subkepala “8424.49” dalam ruang (2) yang

terdapat bersetentangan dengan perkataan “- - Other:” dalam ruang (3);

(at) dengan menggantikan subkepala “8431.39.50 00” dan “8431.39.40 00”
masing-masing dengan subkepala “8431.39.40 00” dan “8431.39.50 00”;

(au) dalam ruang (3), selepas subkepala 8544.49.21 90 dan butir-butir yang
berhubungan dengannya, dengan menggantikan perkataan “- - - Other:”

dengan perkataan “ - - - - Other:”;

(av) dengan menggantikan subkepala “8548.10.29 39”7 dengan
subkepala “8548.10.20 397;

(aw) berhubung dengan Nota Seksyen kepada Seksyen XVII, dengan
menomborkan semula subperenggan 2(i), (j) dan (k) masing-masing sebagai

subperenggan 2(ij), (k) dan (1);

15

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(ax) berhubung dengan kepala 87.02, dengan menggantikan
subkepala 8702.40.10 00 dan butir-butir yang berhubungan dengannya

dengan subkepala dan butir-butir yang berikut:

“ | Heading | Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)

8702.40.1000 |- - - Motor cars (including u 10% 0%

stretch limousines but
not including coaches,
buses, minibuses or
vans)

(ay) dalam ruang (3), selepas subkepala 8703.50.21 00 dan butir-butir yang
berhubungan dengannya, dengan menggantikan perkataan
“- - - - Other motor cars (including station wagons and sport cars, but not
including vans), of four wheel drive:” dengan perkataan “- - - Other motor
cars (including station wagons and sport cars, but not including vans), of

four wheel drive:”;

(az) berhubung dengan subkepala 8703.50.65, dengan menggantikan
subkepala “8703.60.65 90” dengan subkepala “8703.50.65 90”;

(aaa)berhubung dengan subkepala 8711.60.11 00, dalam ruang (5), dengan

menggantikan perkataan “5%” dengan perkataan “0%”;

(aab)dengan menggantikan subkepala “8716.90 21 00” dan “8716.90 22 00”
masing-masing dengan subkepala “8716.90.21 00” dan “8716.90.22 00”;

(aac)berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 90, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k), () dan (m) masing-masing sebagai
subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m) dan (n);

(aad)berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 94, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k) dan (1) masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 1(ij),
(%), (1) dan (m)”;
16

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(aae)berhubung dengan kepala 94.06, dalam ruang (2), dengan memotong
subkepala “9406.00";

(aaf) berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 95, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (@), (v), (s), (¥), (w) dan (v)
masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 1(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (q), (1),
(s), (t), (u), (v) dan (w);

(aag)berhubung dengan Nota Bab kepada Bab 96, dengan menomborkan semula
subperenggan 1(i), (j), (k) dan (1) masing-masing sebagai subperenggan 1(ij),
(k), (1) dan (m); dan

(aah)berhubung dengan kepala 96.01, dengan menggantikan
subkepala 9601.90.90 00 dan butir-butir yang berhubungan dengannya
dengan subkepala dan butir-butir yang berikut:

“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
9601.90.90 - - Other:
9601.90.90 10 - - - Cigar or cigarette kg 15% 0%
cases, tobacco jars;
ornamental articles
9601.90.90 90 - - - Other kg 5% 0%

Dibuat 29 Mac 2017
[SULIT KE.HT(96)669/12-3 Klt.6 Sk.14; Perb. 0.9060/18 (S].22) JLD.2; PN(PU2)338/XLV]

DATO’ SERI JOHARI BIN ABDUL GHANI
Menteri Kewangan Kedua

[Akan dibentangkan di Dewan Rakyat menurut subseksyen 11(2) Akta Kastam 1967

17

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

CUSTOMS ACT 1967

CUSTOMS DUTIES (AMENDMENT) ORDER 2017

IN exercise of the powers conferred by subsection 11(1) of the

Customs Act 1967 [Act 235], the Minister makes the following order:

Citation and commencement

1. (1) This order may be cited as the Customs Duties (Amendment) Order 2017.
(2) This Order comes into operation on 1 April 2017.

Amendment of First Schedule

2. The Customs Duties Order 2017 [P.U (4) 5/2017] is amended in the

First Schedule—

(a) in relation to subheading 0105.11.90 00, in column (5), by substituting for
the word “RM” the word ‘TRQ”;

(b) by substituting for subheading “0303.45.00” subheading “0303.45”;
(c) by substituting for subheadings “0709.99.00”, “0709.99.00 10”,
“0709.99.00 20” and “0709.99.00 90” subheadings “0709.99”

“0709.99.10 007, “0709.99.20 00” and “0709.99.90 00” respectively;

(d) in relation to subheadings 0813.50.40 and 8422.90, by deleting the

particulars in columns (4), (5) and (6);

(e) inrelation to heading 12.12—

(i) by substituting for subheading “1212.21.00 00” subheading “1212.21";

and

18

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(ii) by deleting the particulars in columns (4), (5) and (6) appearing

against the words “- - - Dried but not ground:” in column (3);

(f) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 13, by renumbering
subparagraphs 1(i) and (j) as subparagraphs 1(ij) and (k) respectively;

(g) after subheading 1511.90.20 00 and the particulars relating to it, by deleting
the particulars in columns (4), (5) and (6) appearing against the words

“- - Fractions of refined oil:”;

(h) by substituting for subheadings “2204.21.12 00” and “2204.21.13 00”
subheadings “2204.21.13 00” and “2204.21.14 00" respectively;

(i) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 25, by renumbering
subparagraph 2(i) as subparagraph 2(ij);

(j) in relation to subheading 2715.00.10 00, in column (5), by substituting for
the words “5%” the words “25%";

(k) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 29, by renumbering
subparagraphs 2(i), (j) and (k) as subparagraphs 2(ij), (k) and (1)

respectively;

(I) by substituting for subheading “2903.21 00 00" subheading
“2903.21.00 007;

(m) Dby substituting for subheading “2918.91 00 00” subheading “2918.91.00 00”;

(n) inrelation to heading 39.17—

(i) by substituting for subheading “3917.29 22 00” subheading
“3917.29.22 007;

19

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



(o)

(p)

(@)

(r)

)

P.U. (A) 101

(ii) by substituting for subheading “3917.29 23 00" subheading
“3917.29.23 00”;

(iii) by substituting for subheading “3917.29 24 00” subheading
“3917.29.24 00”;

(iv) by substituting for subheading “3917.29 25 00” subheading
“3917.29.25 00”; and

(v) by substituting for subheading “3917.29 29 00” subheading
“3917.29.29 007;

in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 30, by renumbering
subparagraphs 4(i), (j) and (k) as subparagraphs 4(ij), (k) and ()

respectively;

in relation to heading 34.03, by substituting for subheading “3402.11"
subheading “3403.11";

in relation to subheading 3808.69.90, by substituting for subheadings

“3808.62.90 10” and “3808.62.90 90” subheadings “3808.69.90 10” and

“3808.69.90 90” respectively;

by substituting for subheading “3917.29.00” subheading “3917.29”;

in relation to heading 39.20—

(i) by substituting for subheading “3920.43.00” subheading “3920.43";

(ii) by substituting for subheading “3920.51.00” subheading “3920.51";

(iii) by substituting for subheading “3920.59.00” subheading “3920.59";

20

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(iv) by substituting for subheading “3920.69.00” subheading “3920.69”;

and

(v) by substituting for subheading “3920.93.00” subheading “3920.93";

(t) inrelation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 39—

()

by renumbering subparagraphs 2(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (q), (1),
(s), (), (u), (v), (W), (x) and (y) as subparagraphs 2(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n),
(o), (p), (@), (), (5), (V) (w), (v), (W), (x), (v) and (z) respectively; and

(ii) by renumbering subparagraph 11(i) as subparagraph 11(ij);

(u) in relation to heading 39.21, by substituting for subheading 3921.90.90 00

and the particulars relating to it the following subheadings and particulars:

“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity
Import Export
(1) (2) 3) (4) (5) (6)
3921.90.90 - Other:
3921.90.90 10 - - Of additional kg 20% 0%
polymerisation
products
3921.90.90 90 - - Other kg 0% 0%

(v) inrelation to heading 39.24—

(i) by substituting for subheading 3924.10.90 00 and the particulars
relating to it the following subheadings and particulars:
“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity
Import Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
3924.10.90 - Other:
3924.10.90 10 - - Baby feeding kg 0% 0%
bottles
3924.10.90 90 - - Other kg 20% 0%
21

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia

; and



P.U. (A) 101

(ii) in relation to subheading 3924.90.90 20, in column (3), by deleting the
words “(including baby feeding bottle)”;

(w) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 42, by renumbering
subparagraphs 2(i), (j), (k) and (1) as subparagraphs 2(ij), (k), (I) and (m)

respectively;

(x) inrelation to Chapter 44—

(i) in relation to Chapter Notes, by renumbering subparagraphs 1(i), (j),
(k), (1), (m), (n), (0), (p) and (q) as subparagraphs 1(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n),
(o), (v), (q) and (1) respectively; and

(ii) in relation to National Note, by inserting after paragraph 1 the

following paragraph:

“2. For the purposes of heading 44.03, the expression “Baulks”
means “timber that has been converted with a saw or split by
wedges or hewn having a cross section of not less than 60 squares

inches (375 sq. cm).”;

(y) inrelation to heading 44.03—

(i) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 11" subheading
“4403.49.10 317;

(i) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 12”  subheading
“4403.49.10 327;

(iii) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 13” subheading

“4403.49.10 33%;

22

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



(iv)

v)

(vi)

(vii)

(viii)

(ix)

)

(xi)

(xii)

(xiii)

by substituting
“4403.49.10 347

by substituting
“4403.49.10 35”;

by substituting
“4403.49.10 36”;

by substituting
“4403.49.10 377;

by substituting
“4403.49.10 38”;

by substituting
“4403.49.10 39”;

for

for

for

for

for

for

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 21"

14"

15"

16"

17"

18"

19”

P.U. (A) 101

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

and the particulars

relating to it in column (3) the following subheading and particulars:

“ Subheading Description
(2) (3)
4403.49.10 41 - - - Of Kelat (Ubah)

by substituting
“4403.49.10 42”;

by substituting
“4403.49.10 437;

by substituting
“4403.49.10 44”;

for

for

for

subheading “4403.49.10 22~

subheading “4403.49.10 23"

subheading “4403.49.10 24~

23

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia

subheading

subheading

subheading



(xiv) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 45”;

(xv) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 46”;

(xvi) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 477;

(xvii) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 48”;

(xviii) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 497;

(xix) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 517;

(xx) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 527;

(xxi) by substituting for
“4403.49.10 537;

(xxii)

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

“4403.49.10

by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 34”

25"

26"

27"

28"

29"

31"

32"

33"

P.U. (A) 101

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

subheading

and the particulars

relating to it in column (3) the following subheading and particulars:

“ Subheading Description
2) 3)
4403.49.10 54 - - - Of Limpaga
(Surian)

(xxiii) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 35”

“4403.49.10 55%;

24

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia

subheading



P.U. (A) 101

(xxiv) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 36”  subheading
“4403.49.10 56”;

(xxv) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 37”  subheading
“4403.49.10 57”;

(xxvi) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 38”  subheading
“4403.49.10 58”; and

(xxvii) by substituting for subheading “4403.49.10 39”  subheading
“4403.49.10 59”;

(z) in relation to subheading 44.03, by substituting for subheadings
“4403.99.10”, “4403.99.10 117, “4403.99.10 12", “4403.99.10 13",
“4403.99.10 14", “4403.99.10 15", “4403.99.10 16", “4403.99.10 17°,
“4403.99.10 18", “4403.99.10 19”, “4403.99.10 21", “4403.99.10 227,
“4403.99.10 23", “4403.99.10 24", “4403.99.10 25", “4403.99.10 26",
“4403.99.10 27", “4403.99.10 28", “4403.99.10 29", “4403.99.10 317,
“4403.99.10 32", “4403.99.10 33", “4403.99.10 34", “4403.99.10 357,
“4403.99.10 36", “4403.99.10 37", “4403.99.10 38", “4403.99.10 39” and
“4403.99.10 90” and the particulars relating to them the following
subheadings and particulars:

Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export

1) (2) 3) 4) (5) (6)

4403.99.10 - - - Baulks, sawlogs and

veener logs:

- - - Heavy
hardwoods of a
density  above

880 kg per m3:
4403.99.1006 |- - - - - OfGiam m3 0% 15%
4403.99.1011 |- - - - - OfPenyau m3 0% 15%
4403.99.1015 |- - - - - Other m3 0% 15%
25

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia




P.U. (A) 101

Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
- - - Medium
hardwoods of a
density between
720 to 880kg per
m3;
4403.99.10 16 - - - - OfBekak m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 20 - - - - OfKandis m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 22 - - - - OfKayu Malam m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 32 - - - - OfMerbatu m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 34 - - - - OfMertas m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 35 - - - - OfNyalin m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 37 - - - - OfPerah m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 47 - - - - Of Tulang m3 0% 15%
Daing (Kedang
Belum)
4403.99.10 49 - - - - Other m3 0% 15%
- - - Light hardwoods
of a density
below 720kg per
m3:
4403.99.10 51 - - - - OfAra m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 56 - - - - OfBerangan m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 67 - - - - OfKetapang m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 69 - - - - OfLaran m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 76 - - - - Of Mempisang m3 0% 15%
(Karai)
4403.99.10 82 - - - - Of Penarahan m3 0% 15%
(Kumpang)
4403.99.10 83 - - - - OfPerupok m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 92 - - - - OfTerentang m3 0% 15%
4403.99.10 95 - - - - Other m3 0% 15%
(aa) in relation to heading 44.07, by substituting for subheadings “4407.99.90”,

“4407.99.90.11%,
“4407.99.90.15%,
“4407.99.90.19”,
“4407.99.90.24”",
“4407.99.90.28”,
“4407.99.90.33”,

“4407.99.90.12", “4407.99.90.13",
“4407.99.90.16", “4407.99.90.17”,
“4407.99.90.21", “4407.99.90.22",
“4407.99.90.25",  “4407.99.90.26",
“4407.99.90.29”, “4407.99.90.31",
“4407.99.90.34", “4407.99.90.35",

“4407.99.90.14",
“4407.99.90.18",
“4407.99.90.23",
“4407.99.90.27”,
“4407.99.90.32”,
“4407.99.90.36”,

“4407.99.90.37”, “4407.99.90.38”, “4407.99.90.39” and “4407.99.90.90” and

the particulars relating to them the following subheadings and particulars:

26

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia




P.U. (A) 101

“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
4407.99.90 Other:
- Heavy
hardwoods of a
density  above
880kg per m3:
4407.99.90 06 - - Of Giam m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 11 - - OfPenyau m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 15 - - Other m3 0% 0%
- Medium
hardwoods of a
density between
720 to 880kg per
m3;
4407.99.90 16 - - 0OfBekak m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 20 - - OfKandis m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 22 - - OfKayu Malam m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 32 - - Of Merbatu m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 34 - - OfMertas m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 35 - - OfNyalin m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 37 - - OfPerah m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 47 - - Of Tulang m3 0% 0%
Daing (Kedang
Belum)
4407.99.90 49 - - Other m3 0% 0%
- Light hardwoods
of a density
below 720kg per
m3:
4407.99.90 51 - - OfAra m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 56 - - OfBerangan m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 67 - - OfKetapang m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 69 - - OflLaran m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 76 - - Of Mempisang m3 0% 0%
(Karai)
4407.99.90 82 - - 0Of Penarahan m3 0% 0%
(Kumpang)
4407.99.90 83 - - Of Perupok m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 92 - - OfTerentang m3 0% 0%
4407.99.90 95 - - Other m3 0% 0%

(ab) inrelation to heading 46.02—

(i)

by substituting for subheading “4602.11.00” subheading “4602.11";

27

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



(ii)

(iii)

(iv)

(ac) in

relation

P.U. (A) 101

by substituting for subheading “4602.12.00” subheading “4602.12";

by substituting for subheading “4602.19.00” subheading “4602.19”;

and

by substituting for subheading “4602.90.00” subheading “4602.90”;

to

Chapter

Notes to

Chapter

48, by

renumbering

subparagraphs 2(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o) and (p) as subparagraphs 2(ij),
(k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p) and (q) respectively;

(ad) by substituting for subheading “4910.00.00 00” subheading “4910.00.00”;

(ae) in relation to Section Notes to Section XI, by renumbering subparagraphs 1(i),
G, (k). (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (), (v), (s), (t) and (u) as subparagraphs 1(j), (k),
(1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (@), (), (s), (t), (u) and (V) respectively;

(af) in relation to heading 63.04, by substituting for subheading “6304.19.90 00”

and the particulars relating to it the following subheadings and particulars:

“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
6304.19.90 00 - - Other kg 0% 0%

(ag) by substituting for subheading “6308.00.00” subheading “6308.00.00 00”;

(ah) by substituting for subheading “6406.20.00” subheading “6406.20”;

(ai) in

relation

to

Chapter

Notes to

Chapter

68, by

renumbering

subparagraphs 1(i), (j), (k), (1) and (m) as subparagraphs 1(ij), (k), (1), (m)

and (n) respectively;

28

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

(aj) by substituting for subheadings “6815.10 91 00” and “6815.10 99 00”
subheadings “6815.10.91 00” and “6815.10.99 00” respectively;

(ak) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 69, by renumbering
subparagraphs 2(i), (j), (k) and (1) as subparagraphs 2(ij), (k), (1) and (m)

respectively;

(al) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 71, by renumbering subparagraphs

3(i), (), (k), (1), (m), (n) and (o) as subparagraphs 3(ij), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o)
and (p) respectively;

(am) in relation to Section Notes to Section XV, by renumbering

subparagraphs 1(i), (j), (k), (I) and (m) as subparagraphs 1(ij), (k), (1), (m)

and (n) respectively;

(an) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 72, by renumbering
subparagraphs 1(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n) and (o) as subparagraphs 1(ij), (k), (1),
(m), (n), (o) and (p) respectively;

(ao) inrelation to heading 72.08, in column (2), by deleting subheading “7208.27"

appearing against the words “- - - Other:” in column (3);

(ap) by substituting for subheading “7212.60.91 00” subheading “7212.60.91";

(aq) in relation to Section Notes to Section XVI, by renumbering
subparagraphs 1(i), (j), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o) and (p) as subparagraphs 1(ij),
(k), (1), (m), (n), (o) (p) and (q) respectively;

(ar) in relation to heading 84.14, by substituting for subheadings 8414.80.21 00
and 8414.80.29 00 and the particulars relating to them the following

subheadings and particulars:

29

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

“| Heading | Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
(1) (2) (3) Quantity | Import Export
(4) (5) (6)
- - Not fitted
with a filter:
8414.80.21 00 - - - Suitable u 20% 0%
for
industrial
use
8414.80.29 00 - - - Other u 30% 0%

(as) inrelation to heading 84.24—

()

(i)

in column (3), after subheading 8424.30.00 00 and the particulars

relating to it, by substituting for the words

horticultural sprayers:

”

sprayers:”; and

«

«

- - Agricultural or

the words “- Agricultural or horticultural

by inserting subheading “8424.49” in column (2) appearing against the

words “- - Other:” in column (3);

(at) by substituting for subheadings “8431.39.50 00” and “8431.39.40 00”
subheadings “8431.39.40 00” and “8431.39.50 00” respectively;

(au) in column (3), after subheading 8544.49.21 90 and the particulars relating to

it, by substituting for the words “- - - Other:” the words “ - - - - Other:”;

(av) by substituting for subheading “8548.10.29 39” subheading “8548.10.20 39”;

(aw) in

relation to

Section Notes to

subparagraphs 2(i), (j) and (k) as

respectively;

Section XVII, by renumbering
subparagraphs 2(ij), (k) and (1)

(ax) in relation to heading 87.02, by substituting for subheading 8702.40.10 00

and the particulars relating to it the following subheading and particulars:

30

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

“| Heading | Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export

(1) (2) (3) 4) (5) (6)

8702.40.1000 |- - - Motor cars (including u 10% 0%

stretch limousines but
not including coaches,
buses, minibuses or
vans)

(ay) in column (3), after subheading 8703.50.21 00 and the particulars relating to
it, by substituting for the words “- - - - Other motor cars (including station
wagons and sport cars, but not including vans), of four wheel drive:” the
words “- - - Other motor cars (including station wagons and sport cars, but

not including vans), of four wheel drive:”;

(az) in relation to subheading 8703.50.65, by substituting for subheading
“8703.60.65 90” subheading “8703.50.65 90”;

(aaa)in relation to subheading 8711.60.11 00, in column (5), by substituting for
the words “5%” the words “0%”;

(aab)by substituting for subheadings “8716.90 21 00” and “8716.90 22 00”
subheadings “8716.90.21 00” and “8716.90.22 00" respectively;

(aac)in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 90, by renumbering
subparagraphs 1(7), (j), (k), (I) and (m) as subparagraphs 1(ij), (k), (1), (m)

and (n) respectively;

(aad)in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 94, by renumbering
subparagraphs 1(i), (j), (k) and (I) as subparagraphs 1(ij), (k), (1) and (m)

respectively;

(aae)in relation to heading 94.06, in column (2), by deleting subheading “9406.00";

(aaf) in relation to Chapter Notes to Chapter 95, by renumbering

subparagraphs 1(i), (j), (k), (1, (m), (n), (o), (p), (@), (v), (s), (), () and (v) as
31

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 101

subparagraphs 1(j), (k), (1), (m), (n), (o), (p), (@), (v), (s), (V), (w), (v) and (W)

respectively;

(aag)in relation to Notes to 96, by
subparagraphs 1(i), (j), (k) and (1) as subparagraphs 1(ij), (k), (1) and (m)

respectively; and

Chapter Chapter renumbering

(aah)in relation to heading 96.01, by substituting for subheading 9601.90.90 00

and the particulars relating to it the following subheadings and particulars:

“| Heading Subheading Description Unit of RATE OF DUTY
Quantity | Import | Export
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
9601.90.90 - - Other:
9601.90.90 10 - - - Cigar or cigarette kg 15% 0%
cases, tobacco jars;
ornamental articles
9601.90.90 90 - - - Other kg 5% 0%

Made 29 March 2017
[SULIT KE.HT(96)669/12-3 Klt.6 Sk. 14; Perb. 0.9060,/18(SJ.22)JLD2; PN(PU2)338/XLV]

DATO’ SERI JOHARI BIN ABDUL GHANI
Second Minister of Finance

[To be laid before the Dewan Rakyat pursuant to subsection 11(2)
Customs Act 1967]

of the

32

Copyright of the Attorney General's Chambers of Malaysia



