15 Disember 2017
15 December 2017
P.U. (A) 389

WARTA KERAJAAN PERSEKUTUAN

FEDERAL GOVERNMENT
GAZETTE

PERINTAH IMIGRESEN (LARANGAN MASUK)

(PINDAAN) 2017

IMMIGRATION (PROHIBITION OF ENTRY)

(AMENDMENT) 2017

DISIARKAN OLEH/
PUBLISHED BY
JABATAN PEGUAM NEGARA/
ATTORNEY GENERAL’S CHAMBERS

Copyright of the Attorney General’'s Chambers of Malaysia




P.U. (A) 389

AKTA IMIGRESEN 1959/63

PERINTAH IMIGRESEN (LARANGAN MASUK) (PINDAAN) 2017

PADA menjalankan kuasa yang diberikan oleh seksyen 9
Akta Imigresen 1959/63 [Akta 155], Ketua Pengarah, dengan persetujuan

Ketua-Ketua Menteri Sabah dan Sarawak, membuat perintah yang berikut:

Nama dan permulaan kuat kuasa
1. (1) Perintah ini bolehlah dinamakan Perintah Imigresen (Larangan Masuk)

(Pindaan) 2017.

(2) Perintah ini mula berkuat kuasa pada 15 Disember 2017.

Pindaan Jadual
2. Perintah Imigresen (Larangan Masuk) 1963 [L.N. 227/1963] dipinda dalam

Jadual—

(a)  dalam perenggan C, dengan menggantikan perkataan “six years” dengan

perkataan “eighteen years”; dan

(b) dalam perenggan E, dengan menggantikan perkataan “six years” dengan

perkataan “eighteen years”.

Dibuat 15 Disember 2017
[KDN. IM. S. 600-1/3/6 (40); PN(PU2)100/XVII]

DATO’ SERI HAJI MUSTAFAR BIN HAJI ALI
Ketua Pengarah Imigresen Malaysia

Copyright of the Attorney General’'s Chambers of Malaysia



P.U. (A) 389

IMMIGRATION ACT 1959/63

IMMIGRATION (PROHIBITION OF ENTRY) (AMENDMENT) ORDER 2017

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 9 of the
Immigration Act 1959/63 [Act 155], the Director General, with the concurrence of the

Chief Ministers of Sabah and Sarawak, makes the following order:

Citation and commencement
1. (1) This order may be cited as the Immigration (Prohibition of Entry)
(Amendment) Order 2017.

(2) This Order comes into operation on 15 December 2017.

Amendment of Schedule
2. The Immigration (Prohibition of Entry) Order 1963 [L.N. 227/1963] is amended in
the Schedule—

(a)  in paragraph C, by substituting for the words “six years” the words

“eighteen years”; and

(b)  in paragraph E, by substituting for the words “six years” the words

“eighteen years”.

Made 15 December 2017
[KDN. IM. S. 600-1/3/6 (40); PN(PU2)100/XVII]

DATO’ SERI HAJI MUSTAFAR BIN HAJI ALI
Director General of Immigration Malaysia

Copyright of the Attorney General’'s Chambers of Malaysia



